
Mariah Lewy: A Rising Star in Pop Music

At just 18 years old, pop singer-songwriter Mariah Lewy is already making waves with a
voice that seems to have been crafted by the stars. Born in Sydney, Australia, Mariah’s
journey began long before she could speak, with music ingrained in her life from the
moment her parents introduced her to the sounds of Destiny's Child. This early
connection to music, coupled with a family that cherished their own tunes, shaped her
into the passionate artist she is today.

Mariah's musical path has been nothing short of extraordinary. She began formal
singing lessons at the age of five, dedicating her life to mastering her craft. Alongside
her exceptional vocal talent, Mariah plays both piano and guitar, embracing a wide array
of genres from pop to jazz, reggae to soul. Her influences span from SZA and Alicia
Keys to Bob Marley and Billie Eilish, reflecting her diverse musical taste and deep
emotional range.

Mariah's career highlights include a standout performance at the 2019 L.O.V.E. Awards
in Los Angeles, participation in the Celebrity Experience in Hollywood, and recording
sessions across North America, Indonesia, and Australia. She has also taken on roles
in productions like Grease, performed live at the Seymour Centre, and achieved a High
Distinction in her AMEB (Australian Music Examination Board) Grade 8 Singing exam.
Additionally, Mariah has had the opportunity to perform at Warner Music, further
solidifying her place in the industry.

Currently, Mariah is in the studio, writing and recording two new songs every week while
staying actively engaged with her audience on social media. Her latest endeavor is
fueled by an unwavering desire to connect with others through her music, inspired by a
life-changing Billie Eilish concert that left her with an unforgettable feeling of unity and
exhilaration. Mariah's ultimate goal is to evoke that same powerful emotion in her own
performances, filling arenas with fans singing along to every lyric of her songs.

Stay tuned for Mariah Lewy's upcoming releases, which promise to capture the essence
of this exceptional artist's journey and ambition.


